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DPS Mohali Celebrates Earth Day with Creativity and Purpose 
 
 

"We have not inherited the world from our forefathers - we have borrowed 
it from our children" 
Delhi Public School, Mohali, proudly participated in the global celebration 
of Earth Day 2025, fostering environmental consciousness and creativity 
among its students. On this occasion, the school organized a range of 
activities that brought together young minds to promote sustainability and 
protect the planet. 
The students showcased their artistic talents through poster making, 
bookmark creation, and slogan writing, expressing their love for the Earth 
and highlighting the importance of preserving our natural resources. The 
tiny tots also enthusiastically participated in these activities, demonstrating 
their innate connection with nature. 
Through these initiatives, the school aimed to instill a sense of responsibility 
among its students, encouraging them to become active citizens of 
tomorrow who prioritize the well-being of the planet. By engaging in such 
activities, the students developed a deeper understanding of the significance 
of environmental conservation and the role they can play in protecting the 
Earth. 
The Earth Day celebration at DPS Mohali served as a reminder of the 
collective responsibility to preserve our planet for future generations. The 
school's efforts to promote sustainability and environmental awareness 
among its students are a testament to its commitment to shaping 
responsible and eco-conscious individuals. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


